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STUDENT DEVELOPMENT
Involvement in campus life outside the classroom is an important
component of a well-rounded college experience. Student Development
on each campus offers a variety of programs and services. These include:
Student Government Association; campus activities; student clubs and
organizations; co-curricular programs; student leadership programs;
intramural sports and wellness programs; and community service
programs.

Participation in any of these programs provides opportunities for making
personal connections on campus with other students, faculty, and staff;
learning skills to enhance the achievement of life, career, and education
goals; and applying classroom learning.

For additional information on Student Development, please visit
valenciacollege.edu/studentdev (https://valenciacollege.edu/
studentdev/).

Student Leader Team
Student Development hires enrolled students to work part time at
the College. This team consists of First Stop Lab Leaders, Wellness
Ambassadors, Financial Literacy Ambassadors, Orientation Team
Leaders, Answer Center Leaders, Valencia Volunteers, and Campus
Programming Team members. The student leaders receive priority
registration, hourly pay, leadership training, and an opportunity to receive
a leadership award. For more information, contact your campus Student
Development Office.

Valencia Volunteers
Valencia Volunteers is committed to promoting volunteerism on
Valencia’s campuses and throughout Central Florida. They offer one-
time special event opportunities, and refer students to agencies and
other volunteer projects that best fit their needs and interests. Valencia
Volunteers works with clubs and organizations, staff, faculty, and over
two hundred community agencies.

VALENCIA COLLEGE | 2025-26 CATALOG

https://valenciacollege.edu/studentdev/
https://valenciacollege.edu/studentdev/
https://valenciacollege.edu/studentdev/

